
OSAGE BEACH/LAKE OZARK
JOINT SEWER BOARD MEETING

AGENDA
APRIL 20, 2021 @ 4:00 p.m.
LAKE OZARK CITY HALL

1. CALL TO ORDER

2. ROLL CALL

Mayor, Osage Beach, John Olivarri
Mayor, Lake Ozark, Dennis Newberry
City Administrator, Osage Beach, Jeana Woods
City Administrator, Lake Ozark, Dave Van Dee
Alderman, Osage Beach, Phyllis Marose
Alderman, Lake Ozark, Judy Neels
Public Works Director, Lake Ozark, Matt Michalik
Resident Member, Mr. Gary Hamner

3. MINUTES

Regular Meeting: March 16, 2021

4. REPORTS

Bill List
Revenue Budget Analysis
Expenditure Budget Analysis
Income & Expense Summary

March Alliance Report of Operations

Approval of Flow Charts March 2021

5. OLD BUSINESS

A. Board Representative update

Page Numbers

3-4

5-10
II
12
13

15-34

6. NEW BUSINESS

A. Discussion and possible action of the replacement lawn mower

B. Discussion and possible action to repair the chain link fence

35

35

7. ADDITIONAL DISCUSSION ITEMS

8. ADJOURNMENT

THE NEXT MEETING WILL BE MAY 18, 2021 4:00 PM @ LAKE OZARK CITY HALL
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LAKE OZARK-OSAGE BEACH
JOINT SEWER BOARD

Meeting Minutes - March 16, 2021

CALL TO ORDER:

Mayor John Olivarri called the meeting to order at 4:00 pm on Tuesday, March 16, 2021, at Lake
Ozark City Hall.

ROLL CALL:

Mayor, Osage Beach, John Olivarri- Present
Mayor, Lake Ozark, Gerry Murawski - Absent
City Administrator Osage Beach, Jeana Woods - Present
City Administrator Lake Ozark, Dave Van Dee - Present
Alderman Osage Beach, Phyllis Marose- Absent
Alderman Lake Ozark, Judy Neels- Absent
Public Works Director Lake Ozark, Matt Michalik - Present
Resident Member, Mr. Gary Hamner - Present

MINUTES;

Member Hamner motioned to approve the meeting minutes of February 16, 2021. His motion
was seconded by City Administrator Woods and passed unanimously.

REPORTS:

The February Bill list and Revenue Budget, Expenditure Budget Analysis, Income & Expense
Summary and Check Registers and Bank Statements were reviewed. A Motion was made by
City Administrator Van Dee to approve the documents and pay the bills. His motion was
seconded by City Administrator Woods and was passed unanimously.

Alliance Report of Operations: The average daily incoming flow for February was 0. 935 mgd.
We had 3.0 inches ofprecipitation measured at the WWTP.

Operationally, the plant's discharge was excellent, with an effluent monthly average BOD of 3.6
mg/1 and TSS of 3. 6 mg/1 respectively for February, which represents a 98. 2% or better removal.

The MLSS average for both aeration basins was 5, 002 mg/1. The total dry weight sludge
inventory for Febmary totaled 344, 690 pounds. There were 28 tanker loads or 69, 500 gallons of
septage received for the month.



APPROVAL OF FLOW CHART

Motion was made by Public Works Director Michalik to approve the Flow Chart for Febraury.
ffismotion'was'seconded by City Administrator Van Dee. Unanimous approval, motion passed.

OLD BUSINESS:

A. Board Representative Update: Per Gary Hutchcraft the build for the sludge truck is on
schedule to start in April and should be completed by Mid May.

NEW BUSINESS:

A. None at this time

ADDITIONAL DISCUSSION ITEMS: None at this time.

ADJOURNMENT:

With no further business to discuss, the meeting adjourned at 4:09 pm.

Mayor, John Olivarri City Collector, Trisha Kane



JOINT SEWER BOARD
BILL LIST

APRIL 20, 2021

OPERATING FUND BILLS PAID PRIOR TO BOARD MEETING:
OPERATING FUND BILLS TO BE PAID:
EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT FUND BILLS PAID PRIOR TO BOARD MEETING:
EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT FUND BILLS TO BE PAID:

$

$
$
$

781. 00
61, 274. 97

TOTAL $ 62, 055. 97

OPERATING FUND BILLS PAID PRIOR TO BOARD MEETING:
Account Check Paid To: Description:

4140 391 Naught. Naught Directors & Officers 4/21-4/22

TOTAL

Amount:

$ 781. 00
J_
$ 78TOO^

OPERATING
Account

4000
4020
4020
4020
4020
4020
4020
4020
4140
4150
4150
4150
4170
4175
4175
4176
4176
4176

FUND BILLS TO BE PAID:
Check Paid To:

393 Equipment Replacement Fund
Cole-Parmer 2565898
Controlled Heating
Majestic Franchising
Menards
Menards
Menards
Menards

Naught-Naught
Bledsoe Auto
dark Tire Co

Roemer's Heavy Equi|

9068

10042
10279
10317
10645

4/21.4/22
2122021

130889
19759

Alliance Water Resources, Inc.
Ameren MO
Ameren MO

Ferrellgas 1029634584
AT&T
Republic

Description:
Payment into ER Fund
Annual Re-cert.
Annual HVAC
April
Cement & Rake

Zip Ties
Return Zip ties
Tubing for lab sink
Property & Liab.
Tow

Tire Repair
Sludge Trk Service
March

11673321
98041275

Tank Rental

April
April

Amount:

$ 10, 134. 00
$ 202.00
$ 208. 15
$ 196. 17
$ 46.58
$ 11.97
$ (7. 98)
$ 2. 19
$ 19, 079. 00
$ 278. 00
$ 75. 00
S 368. 56
$ 25. 720. 00
$ 4, 679. 05
$ 97. 41
$ 40. 00
$ 93. 09
$ 51. 78

TOTAL $ 61, 274. 97
EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT FUND BILLS PAID PRIOR TO BOARD MEETING:
Account Check Paid To: Description:

4000

TOTAL

Amount:

EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT FUND BILLS TO BE PAID:

Account Check Paid To: Description:
4000
4000
4000

Amount;
$

$

A
TOTAL



iB-
^Ameren

MISSOURI

. PdvbyPhow 1. 866. 268. 3729

. Pay by mail. PO Box 88068, Chicago, It 60680-1068

. Pay online of inansge your account. AmBrcnMiSSoun. com
n Customer Service. 1.8n, «63736

FOCUSED ENERGY', fsrUfe.

Account Number 4580005832
Customer Name ALLIANCE WATER RESOURCES INC
Service Address 3 ANDERSON RD, .

LAKE OZARK, MO 65049

Total Electric Charges

Total Amount Due nV2X&J£!MJ22fi^4-679-05
Vj
N tOtStt

U 3^-U. 1. r-T-TTHf.

Electric Uiifia in KilnWttt Kouit (kWh)

isoooa
izsooa
100005

AMOUNT DUE

Due Date

$4,679.05 Amount After Due Date

Previous StatBmeirt

Tota! Payments
h'lf.Mi Rew'-.mS rtai* Ysu.

H679.05

04130/2021

$4, 749. 24

$3.481.93
$3,481,83

A-R MAY AN At AUG SEP OCT NOV Dtt_ JAf^
Wt S4-F 67-F ?7*F 78'f 76-F Wf Wt 47'f 35"f

*ni*i* M»n  r»w»lu" 'F)

->-i C^i
k:/' ''-.' m
FS-8 Mifi APR
32-1 3i°F 52°F

:.^L::^^^^. :S
Elecdic Usaga Summary (kWh)

Si lai ihia yai, you're using 3. 8% iBSSlhanlasi
ye-!(

^tt;\st i » >< '. ».. :*, ^
.'B.'O . t.r^,^'-.:-;-; ' . :;,.:'-..s''.<^< > «<:,.*..." i. -l'A,"^,

264,800  h

"".
25<, 720w»

Ui.9u I.W JinAEl t" iO-'O B SOi'

II

5Si SS'nlo-aOcn so we a., ^W ^^ -^n:^w^^-!"" out ll 8 shp and "'a]i . l :"

c:"iipdau. ynu('onl;no accoi, ^, DcE^'t liavii a" snl'i. e accoi. i);? £^ uu tud^y B; AniefonMissuuri. coin.

» Settnuxuaa'i *cl s'.'K'icc dctei!>

^
'^Ameren

MISSOURI

a Check if you haua adiiiBis changes on hack,

>0003SQ bSM70b7 01^ Diei31 10Z

ALLIANCE WATER RESOURCES INC
PO BOX 1385
LAKE OZARK. MO 65049-1985

GL Acct^__Jl(U. S_-^
Sii:naU'rc:_^^/AtW^^/t^

^//n / ^
11 '.'. -KEiiirtfeTi^tiB/tiiivB /iit.^iB--KEiiiTrttr^

Pfcassiiili. r'i ;t-s paiiui, *i'« >iii. i Mlr's"'

$4,749.24

Amount EncSusctt $

AMEREIV MiSSOUR?
FO BOX 88068
CHICAGO II 60680. 1068

Pags I a!4

M. S78.0S Apii 30. 2021

4580005832

2DbDQDDD 0045600056303 DDOOa4b?ei05D DDOD04b7ciOSO



^-
^Ameren

MISSOURI

. Pay by phone: 1.866. 268. 372')

. Pay by mail: PO Box 88068 Cnicago, IL 60680-1068

. Pay online or manage your aecount. AmerenMissoufi.coro

. Customer Sewce; 1.877. 4763736 FOCUSED ENERGY, fir lift

EEieE. lric Service Oclftils

Electric Meter Read

^%^^^^^^^^^^l»SI^^S%nKtti%n10iBi202ry04W7f202f(2a^avs)S

11B7J321

11173121

03(09 -OW

ii 03108. 0007

29

29

Total kWh

FukkW

Aclua

Actlttl

65300. 0000

i. mo

B482D. OCOO

0,0000

.teo. cooo

1, 1883

160.0000

160.0000

78800.COOO

tSO.OMO

Usaao Summary

Total kWh
Total Billing Demand
Winter Base Demand
Base kWh (HUDI

76800.0000
190. 1000
)76,200D

11178. 0000

Peak kW
October Winter Base kW
Base kWh Ratio
Seasonal kWh (HUG)

190. 1000
176.2000

0.9268
5622.0000

Rate 3M large Goneral Service

KscmprioN
Seasonal Enticy Charet
Demand Charge
Basa £ne»BY Chaffle,' Houit Used
Base Energy Charge) Houfi Used
BSM Eneigy Charae / Houis Used
Cuilonw Charga
Fuel Adjustment Charge
Eneray Elficiency Inveslmenl Chafgt
Renawtbla Enargy Ad|uslmanl

USAGE
5, 622 00

130. 10
25.430 DO
35. 240. 00

9.508.00

7e.800.00
76, 800.00
76.800.00

UNIT

kWh
kW
kWs
kWi
k 

kWh
kWh
kWh

@

@

@

@

@

RATE

$ 0. 03560000
t 2.00000000
$ 0.06090000
$ 0 04520000
$ 0. 03S60000

@ < 0.00026000
@ S 0.00559200
@ $0. 00017000

Total Service Amount

CHARGE

t200. 14
$380. 20

S1. S09. 5S
$1. 592. 85

$338. 48
05. 29
09. 97

$429. 47
113.06

t4. 879. 05

Total Electric Charges (4, 679.05

Paynients SiricePrevidus

DATE RECtlVtD
March 23. 202)

AMOUNT
M.481S3

Oueslions? Coniact Ameren Missouri ai 1 87?. 426. 3736 cr viii; AmorenMisscuii. cuin Pl06 2 el 4

Adtffts Changos or Corrcclions

Ntmo.

Addioss
City, Suit. Zip
Phone Numbar_

AiTlorenMissouft. cum. WaysToPav

PHONEr~~-1 ONLINE
^ ; CHECK

ONLINE
CREO. TCARD

^ 356. 266. 3723

MAIl
S1U8&CHECK

IN PEtSQK
FINDAPAVSTATIONAT
AMERENMISSOUBI. CQM
PAYSIATION



^
^Ameren

MISSOURI

" Paybyphunc. 1866.268.3729
n Pay by mail. PO Box 880S8, ChicaBo,
. Pay online or managa your account:
" Cusiomor Sawce- 1 877 42B.3735

II 60680-IOSB
AmerenMissaun. com FOCUSED ENERGY, firlifc.

Account Numhsr 5580005320
Customer Name AILIANCE WATER RESOURCES INC
Service Address 3 ANDERSON RD

LAKE OZARK. MO 65049

Total Electric Charges

Total Amount Due
^^. ^"n . ;r

jur"" \. " ' ^j
^ m i s,

AMOUNT DUE

Due Date

$97.41 Amount After Due Date

J7.41 Previous Statement

Total Payments
Pfyiryisii Sascivsd Tk.wS: '{tv.

1©K-r -T7T51

W.41

0413012021

$98.87

$214.45
$214. 45

Elcctiic Utaga in KilcwaH Houis  Whl

3000
Z500
2000
1500
looo
500

0

Electric Usac* Suromary IkWhj

T.hti showi ho'.v much tleclnc enugy yo'a've usad thu yeai
conr.fiaiei! Id last vca'

I?? ^ i^i i I £? 1 h .,. 1^ a
.

" 
Ipl ^; r% 1^ Si ^' i^' ^. ; ^^ :^ ^- M

Atfl MAV JUN JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV 0£C JM FEB MAR APR
50'F 54'F 67'f 77'F 78''F 76'f W'f 54'F 47'F 35°F 32'F 31°F 5Vf

tiuti Muilh»» rmpwtlut I'n

?020

3, 010kW>

gv^y^^gdipS^gg20?t
6, 120 kw>

Usay) Iram JiwApi Iw ?0!0 A 232!

§1

Keeping YOH tnlorroed. ..,.,,. "....,..., " .....,.^.. -,...
Updli la'your account information so we c<in contact yoii when crews arc Awki 15111 y^ur nnighbOfhaG;). F ii uiii ihu $!sp ac.d mail it.,)

or icdaie vo«r online sccoi.nt. Don't have . n uri.ne accoiiiii? Sigii tip totiay ,u AinaronMissm'ri.coi, !.

GL Acct//: ^-/ 73 /
Signatrre:

Dntc:.

» See ncxi ;'nge for servica details.

^
^Ameren

MISSOURI

0 Check if you haie addfess chanaas on back.

. is ooilufc lor yiiui (ttiirte

Pleasa letwn ihis (imtion with iaw paYMenl

"~frw~f<~,

Pace) ol4

(apljtS^aBs .̂ fet SU ^S.&inKa^AAqB S-^M^g

»97.41

r
$88.87 5580005920

Aniounl Enclssed $

?ooa3MM fastpob? ooo'i ais]>3i i>oz

ALLIANCE WATER RESOURCES INC
P080K1S85
LAKE OZAfiK. MO 65049 1985

AMEREN MlSSOURi
PO BOX 88068
CHICAGO It 60680. 1068

lDb33000 D05SaDD05ci200 0000000^7410 0000000^7410



^
^Ameren

MISSOURI

. Pay by phone: 1.866.268.3729
« Pay by mail: PO Box 88068, Chicago, IL 60660-1068
. Pay online of manage your account- Amsre.iMissouncom
" Customer Service 1.877. 4?63736 FOCUSED ENERGY. firU'ff.

Electric Meter Read

98041275

19041275

03;09-04'07

fllflM-04107

92. DQOO

4. 9880

10. 0003

10.0000

920.0000

43.8800

Usaga Summary

Total RWh
Current Base kWh

Rate 2M Sm Gen Sue - 3 Ph wJOrr.d

Thitstiild »I«ik Oamaiu)

DESCRIPTION

Base Energy Charge
Seasonal Energy Chaige
Customer Charga
Fuel Adjustment Chafje
Energy Eflicienry Invostmonl Charga
Renswiblg Energy Adiustwcnl

820. 0000
9200000

Winter Base kWh

SeasonaikWh

USAGE

S 20, 00
0.00

920.00
920. 00
920.00

UNIT

kWh
kWh

kWh
kWh
kWll

RATE

@ $ 0.077SOOQO
@> $ 0. 04490000

@ S 0.00026000
@ $0. 00581100
@ ^G. OOO 17000

Total Service Amount

Total Electric Charges

1600. 0GOO
0.0000

CHARGE

(71. 67
MQO

09.99
t0. 24
(5. 35
<0. 16

<S7.fll

$97.41

@SBIG!ai jl^d®S ^M^^^%Si^^^^^^^
DATE RECEIVED
March 22. 202)

AMmw
«i4.45

Questions? Coniaci Amcren Missouri at 1.677.426.3736 w v s. t AmefenMissouii.com Page 2 ol4

Address Changes of Corr«clion>

Namn _^ .. .. -,. ",.

Addrcis ... . . ... ^ ..

City, Slalt. Zip . --
Phone Number _ .

AitiefenhSissoiin.com/WaysToPay

("."-j CNtIM
-*:.' E-CIKCK

ONLINE
CREDIT CARD

.^ PHONt
866288 3729

MAIl
S1UOSCHECK

» IN PERSON
FINDAPAYSFA71UNAI
AMERENMISSOURI. CQM
PAYSTATION
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Account

Number Account Name

3020 Osage Beach

3010 Lake Ozark

3030 Misc.

3100 Interest

3060 Waste Haulers' Fee

Total Operating Fund

E/R Fund Income

TOTAL INCOME

MONTH-TO.DATE AND YEAR-TO-DATE

REVENUE/BUDGET ANALYSIS

3/31/2021

2019 2020 2021 2021

Actual Actual Budget Actual as of

3/31/2021

475, 091. 53

74,908.46

0.00

4, 286. 79

26,260.00

475, 836. 10

74, 163.90

4, 500. 00

4, 019.49

39,320.00

473,000.00

77, 000.00

0.00

2, 000.00

36, 000.00

116, 825. 66

20, 674. 34

0.00

1, 110. 00

13,800.00

2021 Percent

March YTD

Revenue

39, 082. 50

6, 750. 83

0.00

2. 19

2, 800.00

580,546.78 597,839.49 588.000.00 152,410.00 48. 635.52

9, 001. 77 8, 955. 85 6, 000. 00 1, 842. 05

25%

27%

0%

56%

38%

26%

106. 75 31%

589, 548.55 606,795.34 594,000,00 154.252.05 48, 742.27 26%

11



Account

Number Account Name

4000 Equipment Replaca Fund

<020 'Maintenance 8. Repair

4140 Insurance

4150 Vehicle Repalr/Main

4170 Contract Management

4175 Elactffe

4176 Ulililisi MIBC.

4190 BankCharflM

4200 Audit

4240 Capital Purchase!

Tolala

"E/R Expanses

TOTAL EXPENSES

.Malnttnnnc* 8. Repair

Accounting - QuickBooka

Auto Dlatof Yify Softwara Fee

Regular Mainfnanca

UV Spare Ptrta

Ducking sklmmBfarm Elec repair

Rock for Road

Chain-lnk fence repair

S*ndbla»t& p»lntclarinar«Z

MONTH-TO-DATE AND YEAR-TO-OATE

EXPENDITURBBUDGET ANALYSIS

3(31/2021

2019
Actual

41,604.00

104,062.97

18,761.00

5,479. 60

299,592.00

73. 278. B7

3,717.52

176.00

2.400.00

145.247.00

2020

Adua'

71,604.00

26, 299. 39

19,865.00

12, 479. 74

305, 580. 00

75, 077. 36

2.485. SB

32.60

2.648. 50

0. 00

2021 2021 2021

Budgt Actual as of March

3/31/2021 Expenses

121.606. 00

36,800. 00

19,200. 00

8.000.00

314,752.00

75.000.00

3. 50S. OO

0.00

2.600.00

500. 00

30,402.00

71,441. 67

781.00

58. 63

77, 160.00

11.229.71

1,727.66

0.00

0. 00

0,00

10, 134.00

785. 74

781. 00

40.65

25.720. 00

3.696. 38

763.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

694.316.96

41. 283. 51

516,07218

85,258. 27

581.858. 00 192, 800. 67 41, 920. 77

221. 000. 00 12. 396. 60 0. 00

735.597.47

300,00

500, 00

15,000.00

10,000,00

5, 000. 00

2.000.00

4.000. 00

36,800.00

B01.330.45

2020 CARRY

802.958.00 205.197.27 41,920.77

"EaulDment & Repltcement

Replace Pista Grit Cart w/machlne work

Replace wooden doors w/fiberglass

Rebuild 3 RAS pumps

Replace lawn mower

Sludge Truck

Percent

YTD

25%
194%

4%

1%

25%

15%

49%

0%

0%

0%

33%

6%

26%

3,000.00

2.000.00

10.000.00

8,000. 00

200, 000. 00

68,400,00

221, 000. 00

12



OPERATING FUND INCOME AND EXPENSE SUMMARY
3/31/2021

Beginning Balance 295, 214. 33

Income - Osage Beach 39, 082. 50
Income - Lake Ozark 6.750.83
Income - Other

Income - Waste Haulers' Fees 2, 800. 00
Interest - Checking 2. 1 9
Income - CD Interest
Transfers From E/R Fund

Transfers to E/R Fund (10, 134. 00)
Expenses (31, 786. 77)

Ending Fund Balance 301, 929. 08

Central Bank - NOW Acct. 83, 228. 09

CD First Bank of the Lake. 2/20/21 #101318432 106, 545. 48
CD First Bank of the Lake, 4/22/21 #101318433 112, 155, 51

Outstanding Checks:
301, 929. 08

EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT FUND INCOME AND EXPENSE SUMMARY
3/31/2021

Beginning Balance 542, 029. 42

Interest - Checking 106. 75
Income - CD Interest

Transfers to E/R Fund 10, 134. 00
Income - Miscellaneous
Expenses

Ending Fund Balance 552, 270. 17

First Bank of the Lake - Money Mkt. 173, 565. 24
CD First Bank of the Lake. 7/30/21 #101318430 108, 704. 93
CD First Bank of the Lake, 11/07/21 #101318434 270, 000. 00

Outstanding Checks:
552,270. 17

13
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30 WATER RESOURCES'

Professional Water and Wastewater Operations

REPORT OF OPERATIONS

LAKE OZARK/OSAGE BEACH
Joint Wastewater Treatment Plant No. 1

Month of March 2021
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Submitted by Alliance Water Resources, Inc. for the

April 2021

Joint Sewer Board Meeting
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SUMMARY OF FACILITY OPERATION

The Lake Ozark/Osage Beach Joint VWVTP produced superior efflu^^al^^ro,u,9hou^month
^^e^I^S^^^e^^itato^^biisKdm^^
^l^'nr^ls^^^ov^a[;;h^zed"reieasesto'waters of the state. No work related !ost time
accidents have occurred during the month.

Detailed information relating to plant performance and operations is presented as follows.

PLANT EFFyJEhTLQUAyTY

Monthly Average
Peak Day
Percent Removal

BOD TSS E.coli Coiiform Ammonia O&G Metals
mq^f mq7l pH Colonies/100 ml as N ma/L ma/L Selenium ua/L

2.9
3.2
98.8

2.9
4.3
99.0

N/A
7.9
N/A

0.0
0.0
N/A

0. 07
0. 14
N/A

< 4.9
< 4.9

N/A

1.7
1.7
N/A

NPDES EFFLUENT UMITATIONS

Monthly Average
Weekly Average
Daily Max

BOD TSS E. coli Co!iform Ammonia O&G Metals
ma/1 ma/i pH Colonies/100 ml as N m.a/L ma/L Selenium ua/L

30
45

30
45

6-9 126
630
N/A

2.2

11.5

10

15

3.6

9.1

PLANT HYDRAULIC AND ORGANIC LOADING

The average daily influent flow for the month_was ^268MGOor42%^o^P^itte^flo^^h ^te
O^coM^n'Q 16%'of the total flow and Osage Beach contributing 84%^ _Dai^influenj^ow BOO
anfcd'ITSSIdata"is'pr esented'in'Table A. Daily flowfor the mont^and rainfall are shown in Figure 2. A

three-year'fiow history for each of the two cities is presented in Table B.

Organic loading for the month was 79806 pounds of BOD.

BIOSOLIDS APPUCATION AND INVENTQRY

Plant personnel land applied 23 tanker loads of bio-solids during the month equivalent to a total of
85, 100 gallons and 28, 883 pounds dry weight solids.

28, 883 pounds of dry weight solids have been iand applied year to date.

Bio-solids inventory in the storage tanks at the end of the month was 585, 000 gallons with a level
of 6. 0 feet in Tank 1 and 7. 0 feet in Tank 2.

16



WASTEHAULERS

The plant received 32 loads of septage during the month totaling 70, 000 gallons.

WWTP OPERATIONS

. Decanting digesters and wasting weekly.

. Normal operations.

. The UV system was started up and running on March 19th.

WWTP MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR

. Performed routine maintenance throughout the month as per Antero Maintenance Data
Management schedule. (New version of Operator 10 Software)

* We had a flat on the sludge truck on the 11th of March.
. We started draining Clarifier #3 on the 12th of March and while draining we noticed that the

skimmer support arms were bent which was caused by the extreme cold/ice that we had in
February. We shut down Cfarifier 3 the second week of February and it froze over and did not
completely thaw until the second week of March. Before we got it completely drained, we had
to put it back online due to the excessive rain causing high flows. We plan to take it back
offline after the spring rains and straighten the arms in-house.

. We installed the UV modules on the 19Ih of March and started them up. We changed out 3 UV
bulbs and replaced 1 air cylinder, and all seems to be working fine. We ran our first E. coii test
on the 1st of April with a < 20 mg/L coiiform count.

. Martin Energy Group was here to do the first of the bi-annual service on the backup generator
on the 30ih of March and ail was good.

SAFETY

* We conducted our monthly Safety Meeting on Back Injury Protection & Siips/Trips/Fails on the
2nd of March.

REGULATORY AGENCY. INSPECTION ANDj^EPORTS

< We filled out the new EDMR on the EPA MoGEM website on the 7(" of April.
< MDNR was here and set up a compliance sampler on the 2nd of March. We did do in-house

testing on a split sample with them to compare results when we get the results back from
them.

* We received our quarterly 503 Regs lab results on the 24"' of March and everything looked
good.

MISCELLANEOUS AND RECOMMENDATIONS

. We invited 4 vendors to bid on the replacement lawn mower and oniy received 3 bids.
(see attached bid sheet)

u We invited 4 vendors tn bid on (he chain-link fence res;)air project and only received 2 bids.
(see attached bid sheet)
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TABLE A
LAKE OZARK/OSAGE BEACH WWTP

MONTH OF March 2021

NOTE: BOLD PRINT INOJCATES WEEKEND DAYS
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Daily Flow
Figure 1
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TAB!. H B
JOINT SEWER BOARD

Monlhiy Hows

2019

January

February
March

April
May
June

July
August

September
October

November

December

2Q2Q

January

February
March

April
May
J line

July

August
September

October
November

December

RAINFALL
2.1

4.4
6.3
4.1
9.9
6.0
4.8
6.0
3.5

11.1
3.5
1.8

RAINLAJA
7.7
3.6
6.1
5.2

5.3
4,8

6.9
2.3
8.4
5.4
4.3
1.3

QSAG^BEACH
32,085,000
29,492,000
36. 210. 000

37.991.000
49. 124.000

49, 051. 000
57,666. 000
53.074.000
47, 732, 000
44.97 LOOO
33.141,000

33.575,000

87%
86%
86%
86%
85%
86%
86%
87%
87%
86%
87%
88%

LAKEOZARK
4, 708, 000
4.650. 000

5.876.000
6, 135, 000
8.333.000
7,864, 000
9, 132. 000
8.215.000
7. 165.000
7. 1()4.000
4.770.000

4.708.000

. y'/o

14%
14%
14%
15%
14%
14%
13%
13%
14%
13%

12%

TOTAL
36, 793. 000
34. 142,000
42.086,000
44. 126.000
57.457.000
56.915.000
66J98.000
61, 289. 000
54.897.000
52. 165. 000
37,920.000

38.283,000

OSAGK BEACH
36. 806.000 86%
31.279.000 86%
37. 286, 000 86%
31.967.000 88%
43.538.000 87%
50.936.000 87%
56.437, 000 87%
52,449, 000 87%
42, 235, 000 85%
33, 173,000 K4%
27.630.000 84%
22.749.000 85%

LAKfiOZARK
5.780,000
4. 986. 000

5.888.000
4, 324,000
6.443.000
7.780.000

8, 616. 000
7, 883, 000
7.636, 000
6.448,000
5. 102.000

3,949,000

14%

14%
14%
12%
!3')u

13%
13%
13%
15%
16%
16%
15%

. lOl'AL

42. 586.000
36, 265.000
43. 174,000
36,291,000
49.981.000
58. 716. 000
65. 053, 000
60, 332, 000
49.871.000
39.621, 000
32,732,000
26.698.000

7B

100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%

100%
l()00/o
IOU%

100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%
100%

2021
January
February
March

April
May
June

July
August

Sepiembt;r
October

November
Ueceinbcr

RAINFAU,
6.0
3.0
4.0

QSAGEJIHACH
28, 107,000 85%
22. 136, 000 85%
32. 848.000 84%

LAKEJ^ZARK
4.855,000 15%
4,048.000 15%
6.450.000 16%

TOTAL. "^
32.962.000 100%
26. 184,000 100%
39.298,000 i 00%
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Monthly tnfluent Flow
Figure 3A
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Electric.Cost Kilowatts Usad
Electric Cost

ts>
4-
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MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITV

Discharge Monitoring Report For Municipal Wastewater Treatment Plants

NAME OF FACILITY

Lai(epftheO"ri(S_Rssional WWTP i»1

LOCATION ADDRESS & CITf

#3 Andereon Road

COUNTC/REGIOI

Miilcr/SWRO

MONTH/YEAR

Mar-21

PERMIT NUMBER

MO-0103241

OUTFALL NUMBER:

woi

TyPE TREATMENT FACILITC

OxidationDitch/UWSIudge Holdlng-sludge is land applied
INFLUEMT

DATE pH
UNITS

BOD
mg/1,

TSS
^mg/L

TEMP
°c

FLOW
MGD

PH
UNITS

BOD
"Tff/L.

AFFLUENT
^Ammonii

TSS
jp-a/L

as N
mg/1

DO
mg/L

E. coil
COLFRM
WOO ML

TEMP
"c

% Removal

BOO
mg/L

TSS
mg/L

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

28

27

28
29

30

31

Fotal

|Avg

Min

Max

7.0
7.2

7.3

7.2

7.3

7.3

7.1

7.1

6.9

7.3

7.2

69

6.9

7.0

6.9

6.7

6.9

7.3

7.2

7,2

7.1

7.1

7.2

70
7,1

7.1

7.2

7.3

7.3

72

7.2

{;'. *"<<

6.7

7.3

198 180

398 476

175 220

203 276

244

175

398

288

180

476

10.8

11.3

9.7

11.9

12,7

9.9

10.4

10.9

14.5

142

13.7

14.3

13.1

13.9

13.7
15.3

12.7

10,3

12.9

10.1

12.0

12,8

14.2

12.7

14.1

14.0

14.9

15.2

14.9

14.7

13.2

12.9

9.7

153

1.609

1,425

1.507

1.438

1. 376

1. 540

1. 591

1.431

1.413

1. 796

1. 469
1.801

3.238

2. 120

2. 622

2. 116

1. 342

3. 083

2.664

1.991

1.830

1.651

1.567

1. 699

1. 557

1.723

1 765

1.817

1.664

1.520

1.490

55.955

1. 805

1, 342

3. 236

7.6

7.5
7.6

7,6

7.6
7.6

7.5

7.6

7.5
7.6

7.5

7.3

7.2

7.2

7.4
7.1

7.4

7.5

7.5
7.5
7.6

7.4

7.5

7.4

7.4

76

7.9

7.7

7,6
7,6

76

7.1
7.9

0. 03

2.6 1,8

0. 02

2.7 1A

0.08

3.2 3.1

0. 14

2.9 4.3

2.9

_2. _6_
32

2.9

^1_8_
4.3

007

0, 02
014

_5_5_
5.9

5.8

6.1

6.0

5.8

6.3

6,1

6.2

5.8

5.3
58

52

5.4

5.2
5.2

6.1

5.3

5.4
6.9

6.4

6.1

5.7

6,0

5.8
58

5.7

6.0

5.8
6.6

63

59

5.2
6.9

0_Q_

_0, _0
0.0

9.4

10.4

10.3

11.0

11,9
9.5

9.8

10.7

12.5

13.1
13.6

13.3

12.8
12.8

13.1
12.6

12.5

11.5

11.6

10.1

10.8

12.6

13.6

13.2

13.5

13.6

14.3

13.9

13.8

14.2

133

'^v^~

122

9.4
143

98.7 99.0

99.3 99.5

98.2 36

98.6 98.4

987

98, 2_
99.3

98.9

98.4

995
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QUARTERLY MONITORING
MONTHLY MONITORING

SM1
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OPERATIONAL CONTROLS/LABORATORY TEST REQUIRED FOR "ACTIVATED SLUDGE" PROCESSES

MIXED LIQUOR

DATE

{SLUDGE I #1 Aeration Basin. 0-Ditch, Etc.
IDISP.
(LBS. DRY

WEIGHT
DO

mg/1

MLSS | *Settleability

m9/l

*30 min
ml

Temp
°c

#2 Aeration Basin, 0-Oitch, Etc. | *Weather Conditions
MIXED LIQUOR

* DO

mg/l

' MLSS |

mg/1

*Settteabiljty
*30 mm

ml
Temp
°c

Outside I
*Ambtenlj*RAIN

Temp
"F I inches

Time

1.2 5,240 850 9.9 1.5 5,340 850 10,2 32 7:30

1.1 5,660 900 10.0 2.9 5,590 850 10.4 30 7:30

3.7 5,740 910 9.4 4.3 8, 110 900 9.5 33 7:30

1.4 6,240 880 11 1.8 6,300 890 11.2 36 7:30

1.2 6,360 880 12.1 1.3 6,250 860 12.3 44 7:30

1.5 6,320 910 9,5 2.0 6,350 900 9.5 30 7:30

1.4 6, 170 900 10.1 2.0 5, 790 890 10.1 39 7:30
1.6 6,250 910 10.8 1.7 6.750 910 10.8 39 7:30

1.1 6,360 910 13.1 1.1 8,390 900 13.4 53 7:30
10 4,629 1.0 6,740 920 13.3 1.6 4, 790 820 12.7 62 7;30

11 1.0 6,860 910 13.9 1.2 5,890 850 13.8 53 1.0 7:30
12 1.2 6,230 910 13.9 1.4 5, 890 840 13.9 48 0.5 7:30
13 1.3 5,070 770 12.9 1.4 5,340 800 12.8 47 1.25 7:30
14 1.3 5,030 BOO 13.4 1.4 5, 120 800 13.3 52 7:30
15 1.5 3.830 450 13.2 1.3 3,830 450 13.5 48 1.0 7:30

18 1.2 5,780 860 13.2 1.0 5,690 870 13.2 45 7:30
17 5.0 6,290 870 12.4 5.5 6,030 880 12.5 49 0.25 7:30
18 1.3 4,340 730 11.6 1.4 5,340 840 11.6 40 2.0 7:30

18 1.3 4,870 800 12.0 1.5 5,380 880 12.7 39 0.25 7:30

20 4.2 5, 880 900 10.2 4.7 5,540 890 10.4 31 7:30
21 2.9 5,700 870 11.0 4.4 5,340 860 11.1 40 7:30
22 2.1 4,840 870 12.4 2.2 6, 110 910 12.5 52 7:30

23 4,690 1.7 8.490 850 14.0 1.0 5,970 870 13,9 56 0.3 7:30
24 7.221 2,5 6,970 910 13.1 3.7 5,750 860 13.2 52 0.2 7:30
25 1.3 6,570 900 13.9 1.6 6,210 840 14.0 48 7:30
26 1.1 6,530 890 13.4 1.8 6,060 860 14 46 0.3 7:30
27 1.3 5,700 870 14.5 1.4 6, 150 900 14.7 50 7:30
28 1.6 6,650 870 14.4 1.8 6,220 850 14.6 46 7:30
29 1.7 7, 370 910 14.0 1.7 5.020 880 14.1 45 7:30
30 6, 172 1.7 6.800 900 14.2 1.8 6,700 890 14.1 55 7:30
31

;OMMENT

6, 172 1.7 6,830 910 13.1 1.7 6, 330 900 13.1 41 7:30

FESTS PERFORMED BY (PRINT)

John Homback

DATE

4/6/2021(573)365-0455
REPORT APPROVED BY (PRINT)

Gary Hutchcraft
DATE

4/6/2021
*Required Daily (Monday -/Friday) ^
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Lake of the Ozarlts Regional
WWTP1
#3 Andaraon Road

LAK1: OZARK. MO, Miller

State of Missouri
Department of Natural Resources

National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System (NPDES)
Discharge Monitoring Report (DMR)

Permit Numlrer ; Oulfall Number

MOOIO.U.iI I fllllA

Mnnituring Pcrind

!. }:11 ^ J'31'21

NO»I! i**<**

CRntra! Field Operations
P 0 Box 176
Jefferson City, MO. 65102

Parametm

BOD, 5-day, 20 dcg. C

Mun. lucaiion, : lindt. ifl'ipf

Sampli; Type: 24 Hour Coinpt 'site

i Fictiucncy: Weekly

Rtpnrtlng Kequircmcnts ' t'uU ' Reporting Kequirements

»«»»»' j ^j^ J 2.9 ' ii,j('l ***** j| ****»

..*";"*», I Wcvkly Avy, :45 i Monlitly Avg.;30 , .***.;«***» [{. *«.«;.

Unit

I Flow, iu conduit ur thru
trfalnimt plant

Men. I.dfaliuii.; End of Pipe"

S. implf Type: Total Mca.sured

l-ri'qilntcy: Daily

Ip"

J...
7.1

-1.3

, Nitrug<;n, ammunia total (as
N)

U. l-i

Mun. I witiun. : Knd oFPipc j Daily M;ix.:l 1.5 r «***.:****»

Saiuple Type: (Jrob f, r.

f'ruqi ivncy: Weekly I

Oil and gruatt: (soxhlet extr.)
tot.

<4.9

Mnit. I ocalio!), : Fiul iirPipu '! Daiiy Max:! 5

Saniple lypr: (ii-ih ;1

11 i.'.iiii. iicy. Mdiithiy

-U3S I 805 M,!, ll tl

-J-.....

7.9

\kt\inHim:'?.0

St!

Dailv -| Monthly
Ma>.. ;Munitoiing . | Avg. :Motiiiuri«y
Rtt|uin;d , Required

**4^* ;> +4***

Mon. l.tWilion. : Eiid ol'Pipe I Mininiuin;6.5

< Suinplf Type: (irab
ii

t'rctiut.wy: Wcfkly

Total Suspended Solids (TSS) *****

|Mt>n. l.. oniion. :Endu('fipB ; **»««;»»».. p Wcct.ly Av|;. :4j , Momllly Avt;. :3()

Sampli; Type: 24 liuu( Cunipt isiti; ,| ]

! I:l'<;quciKy: Weekly j! !

2,9 nie/'l., «'tt*4* il *-*<. **

0.07 I' ing/I.

MouUily AVB.:2J

<4.9

Mor'lliiy Avg. :10

mi;;'L

Sclcniuni (Sc), tulal
i rccoverabtc

1.7

Mon. lWiiti(<n.:mu)i>fripc !! Daily Max.i'i. I ;». *... ;*»«*»

Srtinplc Type: (. ir.ib \

j I'retjUt ncy: Monthly || ]

1,7

^iintiity Av.s' :3.6

Ug'l

BOO, 5-day, pcrcciit rrmoval

MIIB. 1 ncalion.: rniJ<ifl''ipe

, Saiitpk' Typi- tdlculak'ti

I njqikiticy: Manthiy

OX.2

Montliiy Avg.
Miii. :ii5
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Lake of the Ozarks Regional
WWTP1
#3 Andef.on Road
LAKE OZARK, MO, Miller

State of Missouri
Department of Natural Rasources

National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System (NPDES)
Discharge Monitoring Report (DMR)

Central Field Oparations
PO Box 176
Jefferson City, MO, 65102

Siispeudcd Solids, percent
1 removal

M»n. Location. : EiuloH'ipe

j Saniplc Type: Calculislvd

j Frc>]iii;iicy: Muntlily

98.4

I Monlhly Avg.
i Miii.:S5

; Coinmcnts:

29



Lake of the Ozarks Regional
WWTP1
S3 Antlfcii. on Road
I. AKE OZARK, MO, Mt!l6r

State of Missouri

Department of Natural Resources
National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System (NPDES)

Discharge Monitoring Report (DMR)

Central Field Operations
P 080x176
Jefferson City, MO, 65102

I't'rmit Nuiiilirr Oulfall Nunihcr

M()Uli!l:4. S.M2A

Monitoring l'(r"iil

1-i/l -< .'I 21

\oni: »"*

Parameters

IIardnuss, total (as CaC03)

! Mon. I.Hcatioii. : Insircam
i Moiiiloiing

Saiiipk- 'I ypi;; (jrab

Iiequeiuy: Mtinlhly

t'ommcntt: >

Reporting Rfiqulrttttent'i

319 i ***** 319

Daiiy
I Max.:Monitoring

RnTuired

MoiUhly
Avi;. : Monitoring
Rt-quia'd

Unit

mg.T

RcpadinR Rcquirrmcnt!> t'nit

30



Lake of the Ozarks Regional
WWTP1
#3 Aiiderson Road

LAKE OZARK, MO. Miller

State of Missouri
Departrnsnt of Natural Resources

National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System (NPDES)
Discharge Monitoring Report (DMR)

Central Field Operations
P OBox176
Jeffsrson City, MO, 65102

( ci-rttiy uitediT pcOfdlyAftiiw that t)H<i iiorunttHl af)i. !' All ttitisk'hitifnt^ ncr*' pni^irftiuiulcr IB> iiir«l<i«*n or )i.ypr¥\i<. iminbi;<'(t»dAnLewittt a ^. '**<. »< d^ijiiifri tuatuirc ihMi qH sUfi&d pfr^onnet pr<'ipfrly eaili?r and f^atuAic |
I tt)Li infornuti(>a&ubnuuc<l, Ilahediin in> taquif) iintir pffuio oi-pcrsi Utit wlui iiuuittic ih? kyst^iii, tir ihinv pfrwni*. tlfncd) r^punubli-ror^aihrriniE; itu iulunnaiifia, iht; tiifonnatiitn ̂ ubtniit^d ji, toihvl>c\t or ad

kflit'nlcdcf and belief, Irur. Kccutatt% and ̂ ynipt^tc. I a<ti ;twan' that ttirr'v are tiynilicafti p<LiialUrt for subiitUtint; ?*fh<- infurwitliua. liicluding the puisibilii) of Rnv tnd imprhonmrnt for kBnning viuiuliooi. |

eSigaature
Can' Hutrlicraft

Subini'.'iiuu Uatc

; April 7. 21)21
Vsvr Phoiic Numh-r

(573).<6S-U455

31



I
I
"
.
 
I

I .(

". !

1 §
.

<
'

^
S -

 
- 

i 3

.X
 

^
 

~ 
» 

\ 
(,

\lk\

,*,

I

1 
-. 

' fl 
-}

"
 I

iir_
:''-i7

:.i";jiT
;

32



Semi - Annual 1 & 1 Flow Report
Wastewater Treatment Summary for the City of Lake Ozark

(Million Gallons)

2020 - 2021
October November December January February March

L.O. Total MG 6.448 5. 102 3.949 4.855 4. 048 6.450
L.O. Peak MG 0.355 0.278 0. 150 0. 375 0. 209 0.439
Avg. Daily MG 0. 208 0. 170 0. 127 0, 157 0. 145 0.208

% Diff. 71% 64% 18% 139% 44% 111%

Rainfall Inches 5.8 4.3 1.3 6.0 3.0 7.1
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Semi - Annual I & I Flow Report
Wastewater Treatment Summary for the City of Osage Beach

(Million Gallons)

2020 - 2021

October November December January February March

32. 848O. B. Total MG 33. 173 27. 630 22.749 28. 107 22. 136

O.B. Peak MG 1.915 1. 813 0.833 1.856 0. 988 >. 175

Avg. Daily MG 1. 070 0.921 0,734 0.907 0. 791 1.060

% Diff. 79% 97% 13% 105% 25% 105%

Rainfall Inches 5.8 4.3 1.3 6.0 3.0 7.1
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V.ATCRRtSOURGLS"

rrote.ttwiul Vifws »w4 w^-.Tfwiwr Ofwwtifuii

Bidder

Midway Rental

Bids for a Replacement Lawn Mower, Garden Tractor vs Zero Turn

budgeted Amount I Total Bid | _Commercial Grade Equipment
$6,00000 No bid No bid

Warrant

Heritage Tractor, $7, 347, 16_ John Deere X730 w/ 25. 5 hp 4y®a[
Lebanon Garden Tractor w/ 48" Deck Bumper to Bumper

$6, 559. 60 John Deere Z915E Ztrak w/ 25 hp 3 year
Zero Turn w/ 48" Deck

Sydenstricker Nobbe $7, 991. 38 John Deere X730 w/ 25. 5 hp

Bumper to Bumper

4 year
Partners, Tipton Garden Tractor w/ 48" Deck Bumper to Bumper

$5, 962.64 John Deere 2915E Ztrak w/ 25 hp 3 year
Zero Turn w/ 48" Deck Bumper to Bumper

Crown Power $7,600.00 Kubota GR2020G3-48 w/ 20. 5 hp 3 year
Eldon AWD Garden Tractor w/ 48" Deck

$5, 700.00 Kubota Z412KW-48 w/ 22 hp
Unlimited hrs

2 year
Zero Turn w/ 48" Deck Unlimited hrs

Bids for the Repair of the Chain-tlnk Fence

Bidder

Lake Central Fence

Chain-Link Fence Co.

Reliable Seroices

Truesdell Fence

Budgeted Amount
$4, 000.00

Total Bid
No bid

No bid

$6,650.00

$3,400. 00

Fence Repair/Post Replacement
No bid

No bid

Straighten post near 9ate_£archase_and^
replace 16 - 2. 5" post on farside, tie in
and finish, posts to be cut out and new

ones surface mounted in steel surface

mount post mounts w/ concrete sets
& dispose of old material

F urnish and insta!134 - 2 3/8" s40 post
to replace loose or missing post, 2jwj_

ends, 1 brace rail, dome cag.s_
-3iL.£OSLSetJrLconcIete-

35


